Inc.

Response Notes

Total Bid Medicaleshop Inc. 1.00
Subtotal: Required Items 1.00
Subtotal: Optional Items 0.00
Product Line Items Medicaleshop Inc. 1.00
Group P1: Mobility Items Medicaleshop Inc. 0.00
P1.1 Aluminium Rollator Medicaleshop Inc. (quantity 1)
Unit Price 0.00
Item Total Price 0.00

Commodity Code

46576 - Physical Therapy Equipment and Supplies

Catalog Number

Description Aluminum frame with ergonomic handles. User weight capacity of 365 Ibs.
Quantity 1.00
Estimated Delivery Date
Comment (Optional) No Bid
P1.2 Standard Manual Wheelchair Medicaleshop Inc. (quantity 1)
Unit Price 0.00
Item Total Price 0.00

Commodity Code

46576 - Physical Therapy Equipment and Supplies

Catalog Number

Description 20" X 16" wheelchair. Supports patients up to 250 Ibs.
Quantity 1.00
Estimated Delivery Date
Comment (Optional) No Bid
P1.3 Adult Folding Patient Walker Medicaleshop Inc. (quantity 1)
Unit Price 0.00
Item Total Price 0.00

Commodity Code

46576 - Physical Therapy Equipment and Supplies

Catalog Number

Aluminum construction to ensure strength as well as lightweight. Must be able to support

Description

Quantity 1.00

Estimated Delivery Date

Comment (Optional) No Bid
P1.4 Stable Base Quad Cane Medicaleshop Inc. (quantity 1)

Unit Price 0.00

Item Total Price 0.00

Commodity Code

46576 - Physical Therapy Equipment and Supplies

Catalog Number

Height adjusts from 29"-38" with a small base of 7"W X 5"L. Weight capacity of 300 lbs.

Description

Quantity 1.00

Estimated Delivery Date

Comment (Optional) No Bid
Group P2: Wound Care Items Medicaleshop Inc. 0.00

P2.1 First Aid Kit Medicaleshop Inc. (quantity 1)
Unit Price 0.00
Item Total Price 0.00

Commodity Code

46576 - Physical Therapy Equipment and Supplies

Catalog Number

Description Assortment of 112 first aid medical pieces that is able to support up to 25 people
Quantity 1.00
Estimated Delivery Date
Comment (Optional) No Bid
P2.2 Cotton Stockinette Medicaleshop Inc. (quantity 1)
Unit Price 0.00
Item Total Price 0.00

Commodity Code

46576 - Physical Therapy Equipment and Supplies

Catalog Number

Description Measures up to 25 yards in length with a width of 3".
Quantity 1.00
Estimated Delivery Date
Comment (Optional) No Bid
P2.3 Leg Sleeve Medicaleshop Inc. (quantity 1)
Unit Price 0.00
Item Total Price 0.00

Commodity Code

46576 - Physical Therapy Equipment and Supplies

Catalog Number

Description

Small (9" - 12") full leg sleeve that will stay in place to protect fragile skin from pressure,
friction, and minor traumas that result in tears, bruising, and abrasions.

Quantity

1.00

Estimated Delivery Date

Comment (Optional) No Bid
P2.4 Plastic and Sheer Strip Adhesive Bandages Medicaleshop Inc. (quantity 1)

Unit Price 0.00

Item Total Price 0.00

Commodity Code

46576 - Physical Therapy Equipment and Supplies

Catalog Number

Description

Sheer and plastic bandages to aid in keeping out foreign bodies and facilitate the healing

Quantity

1.00

Estimated Delivery Date

Comment (Optional) No Bid
P2.5 Stay-Put Heel Protector Medicaleshop Inc. (quantity 1)

Unit Price 0.00

Item Total Price 0.00

Commodity Code

46576 - Physical Therapy Equipment and Supplies

Catalog Number

Description Must have layers enough of to reduce pressure and friction on the heel and malleolus.
Quantity 1.00
Estimated Delivery Date
Comment (Optional) No Bid
Group P3: Daily Living Items Medicaleshop Inc. 0.00
P3.1 Shower Chair with Back Medicaleshop Inc. (quantity 1)
Unit Price 0.00
Item Total Price 0.00




Commodity Code

46576 - Physical Therapy Equipment and Supplies

Catalog Number

Description Must have heavy-duty, rust proof frame with a weight capacity of 315 pounds.
Quantity 1.00
Estimated Delivery Date
Comment (Optional) No Bid
P3.2 Humidifier Medicaleshop Inc. (quantity 1)
Unit Price 0.00
Item Total Price 0.00

Commodity Code

46576 - Physical Therapy Equipment and Supplies

Catalog Number

Description

2.5 L tank allows for a single tank to run up to 24 hours continuously.

Quantity

1.00

Estimated Delivery Date

Comment (Optional) No Bid
P3.3 Reaching Aid Medicaleshop Inc. (quantity 1)

Unit Price 0.00

Item Total Price 0.00

Commodity Code

46576 - Physical Therapy Equipment and Supplies

Catalog Number

Must be able to pick up dropped items. Length of 26.5"

Description

Quantity 1.00

Estimated Delivery Date

Comment (Optional) No Bid
P3.4 Gait Belt Medicaleshop Inc. (quantity 1)

Unit Price 0.00

Item Total Price 0.00

Commodity Code

46576 - Physical Therapy Equipment and Supplies

Catalog Number

Gait belt intended for a single patient use. 54" L

Description

Quantity 1.00

Estimated Delivery Date

Comment (Optional) No Bid
P3.5 Overbed Table Medicaleshop Inc. (quantity 1)

Unit Price 0.00

Item Total Price 0.00

Commodity Code

46576 - Physical Therapy Equipment and Supplies

Catalog Number

Description

Height can be adjusted with the ratchet handle from 29 %4” to 41 %”. Maximum weight

Quantity

1.00

Estimated Delivery Date

Comment (Optional) No Bid
P3.6 Large Weighted Blanket Medicaleshop Inc. (quantity 1)

Unit Price 0.00

Item Total Price 0.00

Commodity Code

46576 - Physical Therapy Equipment and Supplies

Catalog Number

Description Flame-retardant material, weights made of lead-free steel shot within vinyl strips. Weights
Quantity 1.00
Estimated Delivery Date
Comment (Optional) No Bid
P3.7 Deluxe Bath Grab Rail Medicaleshop Inc. (quantity 1)
Unit Price 0.00
Item Total Price 0.00

Commodity Code

46576 - Physical Therapy Equipment and Supplies

Catalog Number

Measures 19-1/2" tall with clamp with adjustments of 3" to 7" to help maintain balance.

Description

Quantity 1.00

Estimated Delivery Date

Comment (Optional) No Bid
Group P4: Splints and Braces Medicaleshop Inc. 0.00

P4.1 Ankle Brace Medicaleshop Inc. (quantity 1)
Unit Price 0.00
Item Total Price 0.00

Commodity Code

Catalog Number

46576 - Physical Therapy Equipment and Supplies

Description Compression and support with sprains, and swelling and other ankle injuries. Size medium
Quantity 1.00
Estimated Delivery Date
Comment (Optional) No Bid
P4.2 Elbow Brace Medicaleshop Inc. (quantity 1)
Unit Price 0.00
Item Total Price 0.00

Commodity Code

46576 - Physical Therapy Equipment and Supplies

Catalog Number

Description

Thick cushion cuffs, self-padded, washable fabric with hook-and-loop fasteners. Fits left or

Quantity

1.00

Estimated Delivery Date

Comment (Optional) No Bid
P4.3 Wraparound Hinged Knee Brace Medicaleshop Inc. (quantity 1)

Unit Price 0.00

Item Total Price 0.00

Commodity Code

46576 - Physical Therapy Equipment and Supplies

Catalog Number

Description Made of neoprene material, with hinges molded into the brace. Fits left or right. Small size
Quantity 1.00
Estimated Delivery Date
Comment (Optional) No Bid
P4.4 Wrist Hand Brace Medicaleshop Inc. (quantity 1)
Unit Price 0.00
Item Total Price 0.00

Commodity Code

46576 - Physical Therapy Equipment and Supplies

Catalog Number

Description

Must provide sturdy protection for wrist injuries and promotes increased circulation to aid




Quantity 1.00

Estimated Delivery Date

Comment (Optional) No Bid
P4.5 Adjustable Sports Shoulder Medicaleshop Inc. (quantity 1)

Unit Price 0.00

Item Total Price 0.00

Commodity Code

46576 - Physical Therapy Equipment and Supplies

Catalog Number

Description

Must provide protection, warmth, and support for various shoulder injuries, tendonitis,
arthritis, and other shoulder conditions. Must have adjustable strap allows for a one size

Quantity

1.00

Estimated Delivery Date

Comment (Optional) No Bid
Group P5: Clinic Equipment Medicaleshop Inc. 0.00
P5.1 Over the door Pulley System with Metal Bracket Medicaleshop Inc. (quantity 1)
Unit Price 0.00
Item Total Price 0.00

Commodity Code

46576 - Physical Therapy Equipment and Supplies

Catalog Number

85-inch nylon cord length

Description

Quantity 1.00

Estimated Delivery Date

Comment (Optional) No Bid
P5.2 Vinyl-Coated Cast Iron Dumbbells Medicaleshop Inc. (quantity 1)

Unit Price 0.00

Item Total Price 0.00

Commodity Code

46576 - Physical Therapy Equipment and Supplies

Catalog Number

1lb Vinyl-Coated Cast Iron Dumbbell

Description

Quantity 1.00

Estimated Delivery Date

Comment (Optional) No Bid
P5.3 XL Bathroom Scales Medicaleshop Inc. (quantity 1)

Unit Price 0.00

Item Total Price 0.00

Commodity Code

46576 - Physical Therapy Equipment and Supplies

Catalog Number

Description XL: 550-Ib./250-kg capacity in 0.1-lb./0.1-kg increments
Quantity 1.00
Estimated Delivery Date
Comment (Optional) No Bid
P5.4 Active + Passive Trainer w BioFeedback Display Medicaleshop Inc. (quantity 1)
Unit Price 0.00
Item Total Price 0.00

Commodity Code

46576 - Physical Therapy Equipment and Supplies

Catalog Number

Description

Must have at least 3 training modes specifically designed for physical and neurological

Quantity

1.00

Estimated Delivery Date

Comment (Optional) No Bid
Group P6: Clinic Supplies Medicaleshop Inc. 0.00
P6.1 Balance Pad Medicaleshop Inc. (quantity 1)
Unit Price 0.00
Item Total Price 0.00

Commodity Code

46576 - Physical Therapy Equipment and Supplies

Catalog Number

Must be capable of improving stability and mobility while strengthening joints. Thickness

Description

Quantity 1.00

Estimated Delivery Date

Comment (Optional) No Bid
P6.2 Rubber Medicine Balls Medicaleshop Inc. (quantity 1)

Unit Price 0.00

Item Total Price 0.00

Commodity Code

46576 - Physical Therapy Equipment and Supplies

Catalog Number

11lb non-slip rubber material.

Description

Quantity 1.00

Estimated Delivery Date

Comment (Optional) No Bid
P6.3 Nitrile Powder-Free Disposable Gloves Medicaleshop Inc. (quantity 1)

Unit Price 0.00

Item Total Price 0.00

Commodity Code

46576 - Physical Therapy Equipment and Supplies

Catalog Number

Description Nitrile Exam Gloves
Quantity 1.00
Estimated Delivery Date
Comment (Optional) No Bid
P6.4 Heavy-Duty Suction Machine Medicaleshop Inc. (quantity 1)
Unit Price 0.00
Item Total Price 0.00

Commodity Code

46576 - Physical Therapy Equipment and Supplies

Catalog Number

Description 6' Suction tube. Hydrophobic filter. 800cc Suction canister. Plastic elbow connector. 10"
Quantity 1.00
Estimated Delivery Date
Comment (Optional) No Bid
Group P7: Diagnostic & Evaluation Medicaleshop Inc. 0.00
P7.1 Upper Arm Blood Pressure Monitor Medicaleshop Inc. (quantity 1)
Unit Price 0.00
Item Total Price 0.00

Commodity Code

46576 - Physical Therapy Equipment and Supplies

Catalog Number




Description

Must have a digital screen to see and read your results easily. Stores 14 accurate blood
pressure readings. Must have a wide range D-ring cuff inflates around arms measuring

Quantity

1.00

Estimated Delivery Date

Comment (Optional) No Bid
P7.2 Baseline Fingertip Pulse Oximeters Medicaleshop Inc. (quantity 1)

Unit Price 0.00

Item Total Price 0.00

Commodity Code

46576 - Physical Therapy Equipment and Supplies

Catalog Number

Description Must be able to measure and display real-time pulse and SpO2 level.
Quantity 1.00
Estimated Delivery Date
Comment (Optional) No Bid
P7.3 Mechanical Measuring Rod For Children & Adults Medicaleshop Inc. (quantity 1)
Unit Price 0.00
Item Total Price 0.00

Commodity Code

46576 - Physical Therapy Equipment and Supplies

Catalog Number

Description

Measuring rod for children and adults has a variable scale with a range of 1.4" to 90" that

Quantity

1.00

Estimated Delivery Date

Comment (Optional) No Bid
P7.4 Cognitive Performance Test Medicaleshop Inc. (quantity 1)

Unit Price 0.00

Item Total Price 0.00

Commodity Code

46576 - Physical Therapy Equipment and Supplies

Catalog Number

Description

Cognitive Performance Test that must have at least seven subtasks that replicate common

Quantity

1.00

Estimated Delivery Date

Comment (Optional) No Bid
Group P8: Category Discount Medicaleshop Inc. 1.00
P8.1 Percentage Discount Off Catalog MSRP Medicaleshop Inc. (quantity 1)
Unit Price 1.00
Item Total Price 1.00

Commodity Code

46576 - Physical Therapy Equipment and Supplies

Catalog Number

Description

For all items not listed above the State is requesting a percentage discount off catalog
MSRP. Bidder may offer discounts based off the different categories listed above. Provide

Quantity

1.00

Estimated Delivery Date

Comment (Optional)

1-27% on Physical Therapy Equipment and Supplies

P8.2 Volume Discount If Allowed

Medicaleshop Inc. (quantity 1)

Unit Price

0.00

Item Total Price

0.00

Commodity Code

46576 - Physical Therapy Equipment and Supplies

Catalog Number

Description Bidder may provide a volume discount if available.
Quantity 1.00

Estimated Delivery Date

Comment (Optional) No Bid




