
STYLE / BRAND PERCENTAGE OFF MSRP

Aluminum Doors and Frames
Special Lite no bid

Metal Doors and Frames
Ceco no bid

Curries no bid
Dorma no bid

Republic no bid
Steelcraft no bid

Trimco no bid

Wood Doors
Algoma no bid
Graham no bid

Marshfield no bid
Mohawk no bid
Oshkosh no bid

VT Industries no bid

Closers
LCN 49.00%

Norton 50.00%

Exit Devices
Precision 52.00%

Sargent 52.00%
Von Duprin 48.00%

Flat Goods
Burns no bid

Ives 50.00%
Rockwood 35.00%

Stanley 40.00%

Hardware
Adams Rite 47.00%
Rockwood 35.00%

Trimco 25.00%

Hinges
Boomer no bid

Hager 65.00%
Ives 48.00%

Markar no bid
McKinney no bid

Stanley 55.00%

Overhead Stops and Holders
Glynn Johnson 48.00%

Ives 48.00%
Rockwood 35.00%

Thresholds
National Guard 35.00%

Weatherstrips
National Guard 35.00%

Pemki 25.00%
Reese no bid

LOCKS AND ACCESSORIES
Adams Rite 47.00%

American Door no bid
ASSA ABLOY 40.00%

Best (Formerly Stanley) 56.00%
Boomer no bid

Burns no bid
Chicago 30.00%

CompleX National 30.00%
Corbin Russwin 58.00%

Dorma 60.00%
Falcon 55.00%

Glynn Johnson 48.00%
Hager 62.00%

HES 53.00%
Ives 48.00%

Kaba ILCO / Simplex 50.00%
LCN 49.00%

Markar no bid
Master 50.00%

McKinney no bid
Millenium no bid

Morse Watchmen 2.00%
National 30.00%

National Guard 35.00%
Norton 50.00%
Reese no bid
Rixson 50.00%

Rockwood 50.00%
Pemkey no bid

Precision 52.00%
Sargent 52.00%
Schlage 49.00%

Sourther Folger / RR Binks 52.00%
Timberline 30.00%

Trimco 25.00%
Von Duprin 48.00%

Wesier no bid
Yale 55.00%

LABOR Hourly Rate
Hourly Labor Rate for Installation

Craftmaster Hardware, LLC.


