
Harrison County Iowa Prescribed Burns Chloeta Fire, LLC HABITAT FOREVER, LLC Wohlers Fire Equipment LLC

19CRDWBBHICK-0034-2 2501 Liberty Pkwy Ste 176 1783 Buerkle Circle 1449 Abercorn Dr

Bid Summary Midwest City, OK 73110 St. Paul, MN 55110 Council Bluffs, IA 51503

Sites in Harrison County Iowa Bid Amount Bid Amount Bid Amount

McWilliams $5,299.59 $3,182.00 No Bid

Ruffcorn $5,299.59 $2,720.24 No Bid

Thieschaffer $5,299.59 $4,070.00 No Bid

Lindhorst North $5,299.59 $4,854.40 No Bid

Lindhorst South $5,299.59 $3,848.00 No Bid

Dea $5,299.59 $4,158.80 No Bid

Martin $5,299.59 $3,034.00 No Bid

Beckman $5,299.59 $5,527.80 No Bid

Schwertly $5,299.59 $7,030.00 No Bid

Tamisea South $5,299.59 $1,628.00 No Bid

Penny Street $5,299.59 $5,032.00 No Bid

Hurley $5,299.59 $8,022.34 No Bid

Murthy $5,299.59 $5,032.00 No Bid

Tornkvist $5,299.59 $2,553.00 $3,795.00

Smith $5,299.59 $9,176.00 $13,640.00

Total Amount $79,493.85 $69,868.58 $17,435.00
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