1/25/2018 State of lowa Mail - Re: Fwd: 17424A Master Agreement Renewal

.
lowagov Janssen, Julie <julie.janssen@iowa.gov>

Re: Fwd: 17424A Master Agreement Renewal

kasales@windstream.net <kasales@windstream.net> Tue, Jan 23, 2018 at 2:03 PM
To: "Janssen, Julie" <julie.janssen@iowa.gov>

We currently have no separate Hazardous Waste Disposal Rates.

Thanks,

Matt

K&A Farm Equipment, Inc.
437 West Mission Street
Strawberry Point, IA 52076
P. 563-933-2162

F. 563-933-2159

kasales@iowatelecom.net
www.kafarmequipment.com

---- "Janssen wrote:
> Matt,
>

> Please confirm you have no separate Hazardous Waste Disposal Rates.
>

> Thank you,
>

> *Julie Janssen*

>

> *Purchasing Agent*

> Central Purchasing

> lowa Dept. of Administrative Services

> Hoover Building, 3rd Floor

> Office: (515) 281-5602

> julie.janssen@iowa.gov

>

>

> *BE GREEN - Please consider the environment before printing this email.*
>

> On Mon, Jan 22, 2018 at 5:28 PM, <kasales@windstream.net> wrote:
>

> >

> > On Monday, January 22, 2018 10:42 AM, Janssen, Julie <
> > julie.janssen@iowa.gov> wrote:

>>>

> > Matt,

> >

>>>

> > | have not received a signed renewal for this Master Agreement.
> >

> > > Thank you,

> >

>>>

> > *Julie Janssen*

> >

> > *Purchasing Agent> *

> > Central Purchasing

> > |owa Dept. of Administrative Services

> > Hoover Building, 3rd Floor
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