RFB0319542044 Carhartt Industrail Workwear Solutions Apparel and Accessories with Embellishments

Bidder Name: Arrow Safety Device lowa Prison Industries | Creative Media Ink
3.5 Carhartt Industrial Workwear Solutions Apparel and Accessories Specifications
Unit of Measure Cost Notes Unit of Measure Cost Unit of Measure Cost
Carhartt B , Black,
3.5.1 Item# J130 Coat Each $82.33 Each $95.75 Add $10 for 2XL+ sizes Each $130.00/ $140.00 | arMidr:i:r:‘t ac
3.5.2 Item# R27 Bib Overalls Each $86.67 Each $96.80 Each no bid not currently available
3.5.3 Item# S200 Short Sleeve Shirt Each $23.84 Each $27.45 Add $3 for 2XL+ sizes Each no bid not currently available
3.5.4 Item# SO9 Long Sleeve Shirt Each $33.75 Product Discontinuing Each $36.50 Add $3 for 2XL+ sizes Each no bid discontinued item
3.5.5 Item# B324 Pants Each $33.23 Each $38.50 Each no bid not currently available
3.5.6 Item# B136 Pants Each $43.34 Each $47.25 Each no bid not currently available
midnight, black,
3.5.7 Item# B11 Pants Each $35.40 Each $38.50 Add $5 for larger sizes Each $40.00 per pair 8
Carhartt Borwn, Moss
. Charcoal, Navy, Golden
3.5.8 Item# B159 Pants Each $34.67 Each $38.50 Each $40.00 per pair khaki
3.5.9 ltem# B151 Each $64.67 Each $38.50 Each $40.00 per pair Black, Desert, Midnight
3.5.10 Item# B15 Each No Such Number | Each $101.99 Add $6 for larger sizes Each no bid not available
3.5.11 Item# B147 Shorts Each $26.00 Each $31.15 Each $30.00 per pair Black, Navy, Tan
3.5.12 Item# 102080 Pant Each $37.56 Each $47.98 Add $6 for larger sizes Each $45.00 per pair Coal, Yukon
3.5.13 Item# 102418 LS Shirt Each $36.11 Each $59.99 Add $7 for 2XL+ sizes Each $50.00/ $55.00 (Bid & Dark Khaki, Asphalt,
40.00/545.00 (Big & Dark Khaki, Asphalt,
3.5.14 Item# 102417 SS Shirt Each $36.11 Each $59.99 Add $7 for 2XL+ sizes Each $40.00/545.00 (Big ark fhati, Aspha
Tall) Burnt Olive, Navy
75.00/ $80.00 (Bid & | Carhartt B , Black,
3.5.15 Item# J131 Jacket Each $65.00 Each $71.99 Add $5 for 2XL+ sizes Each 575.00/ 80-00 (Bi arartt Brown, Blac
Tall) Dark Navy
3.5.16 Item# R41 Bib Overall Each $85.95 | Each $115.85 Add $10 for 2XL+ sizes | Each $100.00 per pair Cahartt Brown, Black
3.6 Carhartt Industrial Workwear Apparel P Di by Catalog Category
Percentage Discount Notes | Percentage Discount Notes | Percentage Discount Notes
3.6.1 Outerwear 15.00% IPI will quote any other Carhartt (or other
3.6.2 Overalls & Coveralls 15.00% on an individual basis. IPI custom prices all
3.6.3 Sweatshirts 15.00% based on quantity and embellishment needed.
3.6.4 Shirts 15.00%
3.6.5 Pants 15.00%
3.6.6 Shorts 15.00%
3.6.7 Hats 15.00%
3.6.8 Big & Tall 15.00%
3.7 Embellishment Specifications
Cost Notes | Cost Notes | Cost Notes
3.7.1 Silk Screen Printing 1 color small/standard size print $4.00 Set up Fee: $50.00 $1.85 EACH 3" OR LESS $2.00 per print
3.7.2 Silk Screen Printing 1 color medium size print $5.00 Set up Fee: $50.00 $2.50 EACH 3.1"TO6" $3.00 per print
3.7.3 Silk Screen Printing 1 color large size print $7.00 Set up Fee: $50.00 $4.75 EACH 6.1"TO9" $4.00 per print
DEPENDS ON
3.7.4 Alter Shirt Bodi Needed 5.00 6.00 TO $8.00 7.50 h
er Shirt Bodies as Neede $ $ S DIFFICULTY $ eac
3.7.5 Alter Waist of Trousers $5.00 $10.00 EACH $7.50 each
3.7.6 Hemming of Pant $8.00 $6.00 EACH $5.00 pair
Application of Embellishments including Patches, Badges and
Buttons. Embellishments shall be supplied by Agency to the Bidder.
3.7.7 Embellishments shall be sewn on the garment in the location $5.00 $2.00 EACH $5.00 each
indicated by the Agency and in a professional manor not to unravel
with normal wear. See attached Exhibit A and Exhibit B
Embroidery per Stitch. The Agency shall supply logo design and color Up to 12,000 Stitches - No Charge; 12,001 -
of logo to the Bidder. Embroidery shall be sewn on the garment in 14,000 Stitches - $1.00; 14,001 - 16,000 Stitches - 5
7. . 1.00 per 1000 stitches
378 the location indicated by the Agency and in a professional manor $7.50 $2.00; 16,001 - 18,000 Stitches - $3.00; 18,001 - $ p
not to unravel with normal wear. Embroidery 1,000-20,000 stitches. 20,000 Stitches - $4.00
Application of Patch(es) supplied by the Agency - the Agency must
3.7.0 supply logo design and color of logo to the Vendor. Embroidery $5.00 $2.00 each $5.00 per patch

must be sewn on the garment in the location indicated by the
Agency and in a professional manor not to unravel with normal




