

005-RFB-0929-2024 - Bid Summary

Geotchnical					
	Bay West LLC	Terracon Consultants, Inc.	Impact 7G, Inc.	Klinger & Associates, PC	
Service Being Provided	Cost				Unit
Standard Penetration Test	No Bid	\$70.00	\$50.00	\$1,000	Hr
Cone Penetration Test	No Bid	\$70.00	\$50.00	\$1,250	Hr
Bearing Strength Test	No Bid	\$70.00	\$50.00	\$100.00	Hr
Proof Rolling Observation	No Bid	\$70.00	\$65.00	\$100.00	Hr
Soil/Aggregate Testing					
Service Being Provided	Cost				Unit
Moisture Content Test	No Bid	\$15.00	\$35.00	\$18.00	Per
Specific Gravity Test	No Bid	\$50.00	\$160.00	\$114.00	Per
Atterberg Limits Test	No Bid	\$130.00	\$200.00	\$105.00	Per
Nuclear Density Compaction Test	No Bid	\$9.00 Per Test \$70.00/Hr	\$65.00	\$22.00	Hr
Standard Proctor Test (4")	No Bid	\$170.00	\$180.00	\$225.00	Per
Standard Proctor Test (6")	No Bid	\$190.00	\$180.00	\$225.00	Per
Modified Proctor Test	No Bid	\$190.00	\$180.00	\$268.00	Per
Gradation/Sieve Analysis Test	No Bid	\$150.00	\$175.00	\$189.00	Per
Relative Density Test	No Bid	\$260.00	\$180.00	\$268.00	Per
Concrete Testing					
Service Being Provided	Cost				Unit
Slump Test	No Bid	\$70.00	\$30.00	\$5.00	Hr
Air Content Test	No Bid	\$70.00	\$35.00	\$6.00	Hr
Compressive Strength Test	No Bid	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$29.00	Per
Temperature Test	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$5.00	Per
Pre-Construction/Demolition Testing					
Service Being Provided	Cost				
Site Inspection and Assessment	No Bid	\$105.00	\$120.00	\$109.00	Hr
Asbestos Testing	No Bid	\$15.00	\$15.00	\$9.49	Per
Lead Testing	No Bid	\$20.00	\$26.00	\$16.00	Per
Mercury Testing	No Bid	\$175.00	\$26.00	\$132.25	Per
PCB Testing	No Bid	\$100.00	\$71.00	\$242.65	Per
Mold Testing	No Bid	\$40.00	\$55.00	\$32.49	Per
Abatement Design Services	No Bid	\$150.00	\$185.00	\$181.00	Hr
Abatement Monitoring Services	No Bid	\$105.00	\$105.00	\$109.00	Hr
Additional Rate Considerations					
Service Being Provided	Cost				Unit
Project Manager	\$165.00	\$130.00	\$155.00	\$197.00	Hr
Testing Technician	\$90.90	\$70.00	\$105.00	\$104.00	Hr
Travel Cost Per Mile	\$0.67	\$0.75	\$0.67	\$0.67	Mile
Specialized Equipment Mobilization	No Bid	\$520.00 Minimum	\$5.80	\$10.50	Per