Group ADVENTURE LIGHTING I Voss Electric Co Voss Electric Co
Default
1 $2.45 $3.05 $3.05
2 $1.54 $1.48 $1.48
3 $3.75 $10.19 $10.19
4 $7.50 $6.74 $6.74
5 $2.75 $16.46 $16.46
6 $1.75 $14.95 $14.95
7 $7.37 NO BID NO BID
8 NO BID NO BID NO BID
9 $5.00 $9.31 $9.31
10 $7.50 $14.39 $14.39
11 $7.50 $22.61 $22.61
12 $7.50 $15.62 $15.62
13 $16.80 $55.56 $55.56
14 $7.50 $17.48 $17.48
15 $16.80 $55.56 $55.56
16 $7.50 $14.92 $14.92
17 $1.00 $0.00 $0.00
lotal For Default
Total Bid I NO BID NO BID NO BID
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